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Engine Oil (Bulk) 5000 Gallons 3 Days $5.62 $28,100.00 2 Days $6.14 $30,700.00 1 Day $6.31 $31,550.00 2-4 Days $6.25 $31,250.00 1-4 Days $6.14 $30,700.00 2 Days $6.50 $32,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 Days $6.70 $33,500.00 2-3 Days $6.70 $33,500.00

Antifreeze 50/50 Premix 1700 Gallons 3 Days $6.62 $11,254.00 2 Days $5.22 $8,874.00 1 Day $6.00 $10,200.00 2-4 Days $4.85 $8,245.00 1-4 Days $6.37 $10,829.00 2 Days $5.50 $9,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 Days $6.25 $10,625.00 2-3 Days $7.90 $13,430.00

Transmission Fluid ATF D/M 350 Gallons 3 Days $4.94 $1,729.00 2 Days $4.98 $1,743.00 1 Day $6.55 $2,292.50 2-4 Days $5.70 $1,995.00 1-4 Days $6.24 $2,184.00 2 Days $6.00 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 Days $7.00 $2,450.00 2-3 Days $7.50 $2,625.00

Transmission Fluid Transynd 

Allison
100 Gallons 3 Days $26.85 $2,685.00 2 Days $27.97 $2,797.00 1 Day $13.46 $1,346.00 2-4 Days $27.89 $2,789.00 1-4 Days $33.83 $3,383.00 2 Days $38.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 Days $19.11 $1,911.00 2-3 Days $34.12 $3,412.00

Diesel Exhaust  Fluid Option 1 

(Lease Tote)
5800 Gallons 3 Days $1.09 $6,322.00 2 Days $1.05 $6,090.00 1 Day $1.30 $7,540.00 2-4 Days $1.55 $8,990.00 1-4 Days $1.50 $8,700.00 2 Days $1.50 $8,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 Days $1.85 $10,730.00 2-3 Days $1.55 $8,990.00

Grease Proteck Tacky Red 4 Kegs 3 Days $220.80 $883.20 2 Days $235.20 $940.80 1 Day $259.88 $1,039.52 2-4 Days $276.95 $1,107.80 1-4 Days $323.25 $1,293.00 2 Days $369.60 $1,478.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2 Days $252.00 $1,008.00 2-3 Days $218.40 $873.60

Awarded Contract To Lowest BidNotes

Halco Lubricants 

$57,089.00Total Cost Option 1 $53,968.02

B19-05, Bus Lubricants Tabsheet Brewer Hendley Oil

$50,973.20

Northeast Lubricants

$54,376.80

Dilmar Oil

$51,144.80

Harrison Oil McPherson Oil

$62,830.60

Five Points Service

$57,928.40

Boswell Oil

$60,224.00

Mansfield Oil

No Bid


